




TSN/New Delhi
The transport department’s
proposal to procure 1,000
new standard-floor buses to
be run under the cluster
scheme failed to get the Del-
hi cabinet’s approval today
but is expected to be fi-
nalised next week. The cab-
inet raised queries over the
proposal and sought details
about the “viability gap” for-
mula from the department,
Delhi government minister
Gopal Rai said.
“The proposal was dis-

cussed in detail. The cabinet
has made 2-3 queries and
sought a report on viability
gap formula from the trans-
port department. A final de-
cision on it will be made by
the cabinet in its next meet-
ing on Tuesday,” Rai said.
The deadline for the cab-

inet nod to procure 1,000
each electric and CNG bus-
es was set as April 30, ac-
cording to Deputy Chief
Minister Manish Sisodia
budget speech on March 22.
The proposal for procure-
ment the buses was delayed
and was not on the agenda of
the cabinet meeting held on
Thursday. It was expected to
get cabinet approval on Fri-
day, officials had said.

The other proposal for
1,000 “e-buses” will come up
before the cabinet later as it
is being firmed up by the de-
partments concerned, they
had said. Under the cluster
scheme, 1,648 buses are be-
ing run by the Delhi Inte-
grated Multi Modal Transit
System (DIMTS). Another
3,900 low-floor buses are
run by the Delhi Transport
Corporation (DTC). Ac-
cording to independent
sources, Delhi requires
10,000 to 15,000 buses to
meet its transport needs.

TSN/New Delhi
The national capital on Fri-
day recorded the season's
hottest day, with the maxi-
mum temperature settling
at 42.8 degrees Celsius,
three notches above the sea-
son's average.
The minimum tempera-

ture was recorded at 24.2
degrees Celsius, a notch be-
low the normal, said a Me-
teorological (MeT) depart-
ment official.

The Safdarjung observa-
tory, recording of which is
considered the official figure
for the city, registered a
maximum temperature of
42.8 degrees Celsius, while
areas under Palam, Lodhi
Road, Aaynagar and Ridge
recorded 42.9, 41, 43.2 and
42.4 degrees Celsius re-
sepectively, the official said.
The humidity oscillated

between 74 and 18 per cent.
The Met office has fore-

cast overcast skies and dust
storm accompanied by
squall towards the night to-
morrow.
"The maximum and min-

imum temperatures are
expected to hover at 43
and 26 degrees Celsius re-
spectively," the weather-
man said. PTI

TSN/New Delhi
A Delhi court on Friday is-
sued production warrant for
Chief Minister Arvind Kejri-
wal's relative Vinay Bansal,
arrested in connection with
an alleged scam in the Pub-
lic Works Department
(PWD), after the Tihar jail
authorities failed to produce
him.
The court took a stern

view and directed the jail
authorities to explain the
absence of Bansal, a nephew
of Kejriwal, who was sent to
one-day judicial remand yes-
terday after he fainted in the
court room and was rushed
to nearby hospital.
"The accused has not been

produced by jail superinten-
dent, Tihar jail. No intima-
tion from the superinten-
dent regarding his non-pro-
duction. Production warrant
be issued against the ac-
cused with a direction to the
jail superintendent to ex-
plain non-production of the
accused. The accused to be
brought tomorrow," Addi-
tional Sessions Judge Sanjay
Khanagwal said.
Bansal, through his coun-

sel B S Joon, also moved a

bail application on the
ground that all allegations
were baseless and the FIR
filed against him was false
and frivolous. He said Bansal
was currently in Lok Nayak
Jai Prakash Narayan Hospi-
tal here.
The application, which will

be heard on May 14, also said
he has been cooperating with
the investigating agency
since the FIR was lodged in
May last year and never

evaded the process of law.
A duty magistrate had yes-

terday remanded Bansal to a
day's judicial custody while
refusing the Anti-Corrup-
tion Branch's plea seeking his
three-day remand.
In the court room packed

with lawyers and mediaper-
sons, Bansal had fainted dur-
ing the hearing and a stretch-
er was brought to take him to
the CAT ambulance sta-
tioned outside the court

premises. The proceedings
were halted for a few min-
utes.
The probe agency had yes-

terday argued that custodial
interrogation was necessary
for digging out the true fac-
tual position in the case.
Bansal, the son of Kejriw-

al's late brother-in-law
Surender Bansal, was ar-
rested yesterday by the ACB.
Three FIRs, including one
against a company run by the

chief minister's brother-in-
law Surender Bansal, were
registered by the ACB in this
case on May 9 last year.
Three companies, includ-

ing Renu Constructions
(owned by Bansal, Kamal
Singh and Pawan Kumar),
were also named in the FIRs.
In a complaint, Rahul

Sharma, founder of NGO
Roads Anti-Corruption Or-
ganisation (RACO), had al-
leged financial irregularities
in building a drain in north-
west Delhi and that Kejriw-
al and PWD minister
Satyendra Jain misused
their office for grant of
contracts to Bansal.
However, they were not
named in the FIR.

TSN/New Delhi
Defying the AAP govern-
ment's stand, Delhi Home
Secretary Manoj Parida to-
day chaired a meeting of
the Lieutenant Governor-
appointed committee on a
project for installation of
CCTV cameras, in what
could trigger another con-
frontation with the AAP dis-
pensation and the L-G's of-
fice.
An official said Parida

would call another meeting
of the six-member commit-
tee in the next five-six days
and discuss various aspects
such as common framework
for installation, monitoring
and other issues related to
CCTV cameras in public
spaces.
The Arvind Kejriwal gov-

ernment has declared as
"null and void" the Parida-
headed panel constituted
by Lt Governor Anil Baijal,
saying that it was the re-
sponsibility of the govern-
ment to install CCTV cam-

eras aimed at ensuring
women's safety in the city.
In a letter to Baijal on

Thursday, Delhi Home Min-
ister Satyendar Jain direct-
ed Parida not to proceed
with the committee. The
Home Secretary received
the communication from
the minister's office this
evening.
The official said that fol-

lowing the direction of L-G
who is the "head of govern-
ment" , Parida today held a
meeting of committee and
discussed common frame-
work for installation, mon-
itoring and other issues re-

lated to CCTVs in public
spaces.
As per terms and refer-

ence of the panel which has
to submit its report to the L-
G within one month, its
members will recommend
norms regarding storage,
monitoring, access and shar-
ing of CCTV footage with the
government authorities,
keeping in view the privacy
and security concerns in-
cluding erasure/final dis-
posal of recorded footage,
evidentiary value of images

among others.
"While the use of surveil-

lance cameras helps im-
prove safety and prevent in-
cidents of crimes, there have
been reported instances of
misuse of CCTVs for intru-
sion and compromise on
privacy/safety of individuals.
"The use of the surveil-

lance camera system should
not be permitted to become
a tool to violate privacy of in-
dividuals which is consid-
ered to be a fundamental
right," stated an order issued
by the home department's
deputy secretary regarding
terms and reference of the
panel.
It stated the "privacy con-

cerns" related to installa-
tion of CCTVs have to be ad-
dressed appropriately and
effectively and there must be
clear responsibility and ac-
countability for all surveil-
lance camera system activ-
ities including images and
information collected, held
and used.

Staff Reporter
New Delhi

A Memorandum of Under-
standing (MoU)  was signed
here on Friday between the
Confederation of Indian In-
dustry (CII) and Cure, a co-
operative society, for imple-
menting rules regarding the
segregation of urban waste at
source and its management,
in East Delhi area.
This agreement is a step

towards achieving the goals
of ‘Swachh Bharat Mission’
of the Government of In-
dia. Among others commis-
sioner of East DMC Dr. Ran-
bir Singh, director of CII,

Subhash Sapru and director
of Cure,  Renu Khosla were
present.
Speaking  on this occasion

commissioner   Singh  said
that corporation is fully com-
mitted towards making Del-
hi clean and contributing
towards the Swachh Bharat
Mission.
He further said this MoU

reinforces our commitment
towards cleanliness.  Singh
said that East Delhi Munici-
pal Corporation would pro-
vide all possible help for mak-
ing this project successful.
CII and Cure also shared

the work plan for the project.

Initially, the project would
start in five  blocks of two
wards of Trilokpuri, covering
2,000-2,500 houses. During
this, garbage dumpers would
be contacted and trained on
the segregation of urban sol-
id waste and its manage-
ment. Also, citizens would be
informed on correct ways of
garbage segregation, so that
the waste management and
disposal can be done in a
proper manner.
In a nutshell, a model

would be developed regard-
ing the compilation, separa-
tion and disposal of garbage.

TSN/New Delhi
A 44-year-old Russian na-
tional died after falling un-
conscious at the FRRO office
while his deportation for-
malities were going on, po-
lice said on Friday.
Sergey Erin died on

Wednesday afternoon at AI-
IMS, they said.
Erin was detained in the

early hours of Wednesday af-
ter the police were informed
that a man was acting vio-
lently and pelting stones at
passersby near Inderlok in
north Delhi.
Some locals had tried to

control him but Erin was
banging his head on the road
and hitting himself. He also
resisted accompanying the
police personnel when he
was asked to do so, they said.
At 3 am, he was taken to

the Sarai Rohilla police sta-
tion and then to the Bara
Hindu Rao hospital for a
medical exam where the
doctors said he had minor
abrasions, police added.
In the morning, the police

personnel took him to the
FRRO office in RK Puram
for completing his deporta-
tion formalities.
During lunch time, he fell

unconscious and was rushed
to All India Institute of Med-
ical Sciences (AIIMS) where
efforts were made to resusci-
tate him. The doctors later de-
clared him dead, they added.
Police said he was sus-

pected to have suffered a
cardiac arrest but a post-
mortem report would con-
firm the exact reason of his
death.
The police launched an

investigation into Erin’s
death and it was probing
whether he was was attacked
by locals on the night of his
violent outburst.

Staff Reporter
New Delhi

T
he Delhi unit of the
Congress party has
accused the Delhi
government of com-

promising the security of the
nation for kickbacks in the
installation of  CCTV cam-
eras in Delhi by awarding the
contract to Chinese  Gov-
ernment PSU, Hikvision.
It is an “open and shut case

of corruption and compro-
mise of the national security,
alleged Ajay Maken, presi-
dent, Delhi Congress party.
The contract for the CCTV

camera project was not giv-
en to BEL till Hikvision was
included in BEL’s vendors’
list, Maken further said,
while talking to reporters
here on Friday.
He also sought  resignation

of Delhi Chief Minister
Arvind Kejriwal, saying if
Kejriwal does not resign,
Delhi Congress will hold a
demonstration outside the
official residence of Kejriw-
al  on Sunday, 13 May.
An enquiry against the

Defence Ministry will also be
sought as to how the Indian
PSU BEL, which comes un-
der the Defence Ministry,
included  Chinese Govern-
ment PSU Hikvision as its

vendor company,  Maken
asked.
The   Aam Aadmi Party

Government in Delhi has
compromised the security
of the nation for kickbacks in

the installation of  CCTV
cameras in Delhi by award-
ing the contract to Chinese
Government PSU Hikvision,
having 58 per cent share of
the Chinese Government,

through BEL (Bharat Elec-
tronics Ltd) by making it a
vendor of BEL,  Maken al-
leged.
Maken said whenever

there is a tussle between the

Delhi and Central govern-
ments, the Lt. Governor of
Delhi bailed  out the AAP
government though on the
surface, it is made out a
clash between the AAP gov-
ernment and the LG.
Congress president  Rahul

Gandhi had said yesterday
that the Chinese troops had
participated  in the parade of
the Pakistan army. He said
in such a time, it will be a
huge national security risk if
the contract for the installa-
tion of the CCTV cameras in
Delhi is given  to Chinese
PSU Hikvision, Maken fur-
ther said.
Others who were present

in this press conference were
Delhi in-charge  P.C. Chacko
and former Delhi Ministers
Dr A.K.Walia,  Arvinder
Singh Lovely and Haroon
Yusuf, chief spokesperson,
Delhi Congress Sharmistha
Mukherjee,  Kuljit Singh Na-
gra, secretary AICC and Pun-
jab MLA, former Delhi Min-
ister  Rajkumar Chauhan
and  senior leader  Chattar
Singh. Delhirecords season'shottest dayat 42.8 deg C
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n Delhi government compromised the security of the nation for kickbacks in the installa-
tion of CCTV cameras in Delhi by awarding the contract to a Chinese firm, alleged Maken

n Court took a stern
view and directed the
jail authorities to ex-
plain the absence of
Bansal, a nephew of Ke-
jriwal, who was sent to
one-day judicial re-
mand yesterday after
he fainted in the court
room and was rushed
to nearby hospital

n Erin was detained in
the early hours of
Wednesday after the
police were informed
that a man was acting
violently and pelting
stones at passersby
near Inderlok in north
Delhi
n In the morning, the
police personnel took
him to the FRRO office
in RK Puram for com-
pleting his deportation
formalities

n Initially, the project
would start in five
blocks of two wards of
Trilokpuri, covering
2,000-2,500 houses.
During this, garbage
dumpers would be con-
tacted and trained on
the segregation of
urban solid waste and
its management

n An official said Parida
would call another
meeting of the six-
member committee in
the next five-six days
and discuss various as-
pects such as common
framework for installa-
tion, monitoring and
other issues related to
CCTV cameras in public
spaces


